Resort Village of Candle Lake Special Council Meeting

May 26t 2016

A Council Meeting of Council for the Resort Village of Candle Lake was held on May
26t 2016, in the Council Chambers at Candle Lake, SK.

ATTENDANCE: The following were in attendance:

Quinn, John - Mayor
Lozej, Michelle - Councilor
Painchaud, Carey - Councilor
Tarasiuk, Louise - Councilor
Joan Corneil - Administrator
ABSENT: Simoneau, Maurice - Councilor
1. CALL TO ORDER: Mayor John Quinn called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m.
2. SUBMISSION OF PECUNIARY INTEREST: None
3. ADOPTION OF MINUTES: None
4. APPROVAL OF AGENDA.:
193/2016 TARASIUK:
That the Agenda for this meeting be approved. CARRIED
5. PRESENTATIONS, DELEGATIONS AND RELATED REPORTS: None
6. COMMUNICATIONS/PETITIONS PACKAGE: None
7. CONSENT AGENDA: None
8. REPORTS:
8.1 Page 1 — Report #63 of 2016 from Administrator dated May 26, 2016 Re:
Amend Bylaw 28 of 2010 a Bylaw to regulate the operation of recreation vehicle
parks within the Resort Village of Candle Lake.
194/2016 PAINCHAUD:
That Bylaw 11-2016, a bylaw of the Resort Village of Candle Lake to amend Bylaw
28-2010 be laid on the table under Order of Business “Introduction and
Consideration of Bylaws”. This Bylaw is for three readings. CARRIED
9. MOTIONS: None

10. PROJECT UPDATES: None

l1|Page



Resort Village of Candle Lake Special Council Meeting

May 26, 2016

11. INTRODUCTION AND CONSIDERATION OF BYLAWS:

11.1 — Bylaw 11-2016 — a bylaw to amend Bylaw 28-2010.

195/2016 PAINCHAUD:
That Bylaw 11-2016 to amend proposed Bylaw 11-2016 to include the following
amendment:

Article 15 is amended to delete “30 feet” and replace with the number “5 metres”.
CARRIED

196/2016 LOZEJ:
That Bylaw 11-2016 as amended — a Bylaw of the Resort Village of Candle Lake to

amend Bylaw 28-2010 be read a first time. CARRIED

19712016 TARASIUK:
That Bylaw 11-2016 as amended be now read a second time. CARRIED

198/2016 QUINN:
That leave be granted to read Bylaw 11-2016 as amended a third time.
CARRIED

199/2016 PAINCHAUD:
That Bylaw 11-2016 as amended be read a third time and passed; and that Bylaw
11-2016, be now adopted, sealed and signed by the Mayor and Administrator.

CARRIED
12. ADJOURNMENT
200/2016 LOZEJ: That the meeting adjourns at 9:30 p.m.
CARRIED
Mayor / Admlnlstrator
2|Page



BYLAW 11-2016

OF THE RESORT VILLAGE OF CANDLE LAKE
IN THE PROVINCE OF SASKATCHEWAN

A Bylaw of the Resort Village of Candle Lake to amend Bylaw 28-2010 a Bylaw to
Regulate the Operation of Recreational Vehicle Parks within the Resort Village of
Candle Lake.

The Council of the Resort Village of Candle Lake in the Province of Saskatchewan hereby enacts as
follows:

That Bylaw 28 of 2010, a Bylaw to Regulate the Operation of Recreational Vehicle Parks within the
Resort Village of Candle Lake be amended as follows:

1. To add to Section 16 after “...three (3) meters.” The words “unless the abutting property is
a compatible or same use or has an existing dedicated land area directly abutting the
property boundaries.”
2. Article 15 is amended to delete “30 feet” and replace with the number “5 metres”.
Introduced and read a first time this 26" day of May, 2016.
Read a second time this 26" day of May, 2016.

Read a third time and passed this 26" day of May, 2016.

SOV, (). fruct

Nq’ayor Administrator

L7




